
Hernandez Macias 101
Centro, San Miguel de Allende, GTO 37700

Within Mexico: (+52) 415 185 8311
Within USA & Canada: 214 550 4898

Casa Angel AVAILABLE

$19,979 USD

Zirándaro

MAIN FEATURES

• Ref: 6713
• Bedrooms: 3
• Bathrooms: 3
• Half Bathrooms: 1

<p>Price: $22,000 Pesos Plus
utilities</p> <p>Owner pays: HOA
fees</p> <p>This is an excellent house
for a family including your doggy. It has
living room, dining room, kitchen, half
bathroom and garden downstairs. The 3
bedrooms are upstairs, the master
bedroom with ensuite bathroom and
closet, and two more bedrooms that
share a full bathroom.</p> <p>In the
third floor there is a huge roof top
terrace with view to the mountains, a
grill, a refrigerator, and a full
bathroom.</p> <p>The amenities are
two connected pools, a playroom, a
gym, sitting area next to the pool, and a
little house for the kids.&nbsp;</p>
<p>Pets can be consider.</p> <p><br
/></p>

Gloria Farias
415.153.5059 

gloria@realtysanmiguel.com


